SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS BID #071181046
(All City applicable preferences have been applied)

Swimming Pool Chemical

Lincoln Equipment,

Chem Quip, Inc Sierra Chemical Co. |Leslie Pool Mart**

Groups Inc
Small Business Preference No No No No
1% City Limit Preference Yes No No No
Early Payment Preference No No No No
| - Calcium Hypochlorate

Pulsar Plus $207,655.44 $191,229.31 No Bid No Bid
Il - Sodium Hypochlorate

12 1/2 % $42,998.90 $40,307.12 $28,963.20* $45,963.56
[l - Muriatic Acid $26,540.75 $25,008.78 $8,663.10* $20,686.92
IV - Sodium Bicarbonate $4,963.88 $3,854.76 No Bid $2,256.29
V - Carbon Dioxide Gas No Bid $1,296.80 No Bid No Bid
VI - Calcium Chloride $2,068.80 $2,139.92 No Bid $1,143.66
Evaluation Total $284,227.77 $263,836.69 $37,626.30 $70,050.43
Contract Total $286,870.41 $263,836.69 $37,626.30 $70,050.43

* Not all items within this group were bid.
** \/endor declared non-responsive - Addendum No.1 changes not incorporated in bid.
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