Sports Officials

B081181044
GSSA SMOA SASO (LOCAL)
ltem Iltem Description Estimated | Unit Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
No. Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price
SOFTBALL - Option 1 (1 yr w/4 1 yr options)
1 Year One 4980 HR 20.52 102,189.60 NoBid |  ccewem—m 25.00 124,500.00
2 Year Two 4980 HR 21.60 107,568.00 No Bid me——— 26.25 130,725.00
3 Year Three 4980 HR 22.68 112,946.40 NoBid |  e———— 27.56 137,261.25
4 Year Four 4980 HR 23.76 118,324.80 NoBid |  c=——— 28.94 144,124.31
5 Year Five 4980 HR 23.76 118.324.80 NoBid |  =——e 30.39 161,330.53
569,353.60 687,941.09
SOFTBALL - Option 2 (3 yr w/2 1 yr options)
1 Years One thru Three 14940 HR 21.60 322,704.00 NoBid |  cemeoeme 26.00 388,440.00
2 Year Four 4980 HR 23.76 118,324.80 No Bid mem——— 27.30 135,954.00
3 Year Five 4980 HR 23.76 118,324.80 NoBid |  eseeem— 28.67 142,761.70
667,145.70
SOFTBALL - Option 3 (5yr) :
1 Years One thru Five 24900 | HR 22.68 564,732.00 NoBid | ——eemeem 27.00 672,300.00
BASEBALL - Option 1 (1 yrw/4 1 yr options)
1 Year One 600 HR NoBid |  ——em— 28.80 17,280.00 NoBid |  <eermeem
2 Year Two 600 HR NoBid |  ———e—m 30.24 18,144.00 NoBid | =eemeeme
3 Year Three 600 HR NoBid |  cee— 31.75 19,051.20 No Bid |  =ecceeeem
4 Year Four 600 HR NoBid |  «e——— 33.34 20,003.76 NoBid |  =ceeemeem
5 Year Five 600 HR No Bid ———— 35.01 21,003 No Bid ‘nommemae
BASEBALL - Option 2 (3 yr w/2 1 yr options)
1 Years One thru Three 1800 | HR NoBid |  —reeeeem NoBid |  eeeceeem No Bid teted
2 Year Four 1800 HR NoBid |  eememm NoBid |  ee—m—— NoBid |  eeem—e—
3 Year Five 1800 HR NoBid |  e——e— NoBid |  —=—— NoBid |  ewe—em
BASEBALL - Option 3 (Syr)
1 Years One thru Five 3000 HR No Bid NoBid |  eeemm—m NoBid |  eeem——
VOLLEYBALL - Option 1 {1 yr w/4 1 yr options)
1 Year One 81 HR NoBid |  ———— 28.60 2,316.60 31.00 2,611.00
2 Year Two 81 HR No Bid ——— 30.03 2,432.43 32.55 2,636.55
3 Year Three 81 HR NoBid |  ——wmeem 31.53 2,654.06 34.18 2,768.38
4 Year Four 81 HR No Bid mmmemae 33.11 2,681.75 35.89 2,906.80
5 Year Five 81 HR NoBid |  eeee—— 34.76 37.68 3,052.14
13,874.86
VOLLEYBALL - Option 2 (3 yr w/2 1 yr options)
1 Years One thru Three 243 HR NoBid |  cmemeee No Bid cmmrmeem 33.00 8,019.00
2 Year Four 243 HR No Bid e No Bid D — 34.65 8,419.95
3 Year Five 243 HR No Bid — NoBid |  ce——m 36.38 8.840.95
26,279.90
VOLLEYBALL - Option 3 (5yr)
1 Years One thru Five 405 HR NoBid |  =mememem No Bid ——— 34.00 13,770.00
BASKETBALL - Option 1 (1 yr w/4 1 yr options)
1 Year One 396 HR NoBid |  emesewemm 28.60 11,325.60 30.00 11,880.00
2 Year Two 396 HR No Bid me———— 30.03 11,891.88 31.50 12,474.00
3 Year Three 396 HR NoBid |  sememeemm 31.63 12,486.47 33.08 13,097.70
4 Year Four 396 HR No Bid ———— 33.11 13,110.80 34.73 13,752.59
5 Year Five 396 HR No Bid ey 34.76 13,766.34 36.47 14,440.21
65,644.50
BASKETBALL - Option 2 (3 yr w/2 1 yr options)
1 Years One thru Three 1188 HR NoBid |  -—eem NoBid | = ereeem—m 32.00 38,016.00
2 Year Four 396 HR NoBid |  -—wemem NoBid |  eom—— 33.60 13,305.60
3 Year Five 396 HR No Bid maoemm NoBid |  «———eo 35.28 13,970.88
65,292.48
BASKETBALL - Option 3 (5yr)
1 Years One thru Five 1980 HR NoBid |  cemeeewmm NoBid |  eme——— 33.00 65,340.00
Recommended Award Totals
GSSA =Greater Sacramento Softball Association
SMOA = Sacramento Metropolitan Officials Association
SASO = Sacramento Area Sports Officials




