
B17001711001 / Crocker Art Museum Exhibition Furniture 
Bid Detail 

Bidder Base Bid Alternates ESBE 
Mill Creek Associates* No bid $241,000.28  
Gizmo art Production $486,442.01 $375,227.00 SBE 
Ravenswood Studio, Inc. $512,667.00 $451,202.00  
Loran Associates $637,293.00 No bid  
Acme Scenic & Display $661,839.80 No bid  
Group Delphi $728,953.07 $740,590.05  
Superior Exhibit & Design No bid $781,875.00  
14th Street Millworks $815,884.00 $660,066.00  
Proto Productions, Inc. $855,134.00 $639,170.00  
Lexington $984,599.00 No bid  
WB Incorporated $1,009,839.00 $962,799.00  
Bang Creative Inc. $1,219,826.00 $1,161,230 SBE 
Capitol Exhibit Services No bid No bid  
    
*non-responsive     


