Evaluation Summary

City of Sacramento

Department of Parks and Recreation
Aquatics/Public Safety Section

Bid Results B 084734001

Iltem #

Knorr Systems

1 $2,585.00
2 $2,730.00
3 $100.00
4 $132.00
5 $44.00
6 $63.20
7 $298.20
8 $315.00
9 $61.50

10 $2,964.00

11 $2,628.00

12 $6,492.00

13 $4,271.00
14 $13,740.00
15 $5,142.00

16 $28,056.00

$13,842.00
$5,848.00

Award = [N

No Small Business Enterprise Preference
No Local Tax Preference

Lincoln Equipment CC Aqua Tech Systems, Inc.

No Bid
$4,520.00
$128.00
$190.62
$63.54
$84.80
$471.28
No Bid
$79.40

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
$4,780.00
$27,880.00
$11,080.00
Alternate Not Excepted
No Bid

No Bid



